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May 1: 
“Now that I, your Lord and Teacher, have 
washed your feet, you also should wash one 
another’s feet.  I have set you an example that 
you should do as I have done for you.” 

John 13:14-15 
May 2: 
“Consider the lilies, how they grow: they neither 
toil nor spin; and yet I say to you, even Solomon 
in all his glory was not arrayed like one of these.” 

Luke 12:27 
May 3: 
“And do not set your heart on what you will eat 
or drink; do not worry about it.” 

Luke 12:29 
May 4: 
“But prove yourselves doers of the word, and not 
merely hearers who delude themselves.” 

James 1:22 
 

May 5: 
“Turn my eyes away from worthless things, 
preserve my life according to your word.” 

Psalm 119:37 
 

May 6: 
“He has caused his wonders to be remembered; 
the Lord I gracious and compassionate.” 

Psalms 111:4 
 

May 7: 
“See to it that no one misses the grace of God 
and that no bitter root grows up to cause trouble 
and defile many.” 

Hebrews 12:15 
 

May 8: 
“The world of generous gets larger and larger; 
the world of the stingy gets smaller and smaller.  
The one who blesses others is abundantly 
blessed; those who help others are helped.” 

Proverbs 11:24-25 
 

May 9: 
“The Lord’s blessing brings wealth, and no 
sorrow comes with it.” 

Proverbs 10:22 

May 10: 
“Thus says the Lord, “Let not a wise man boast 
of his wisdom, and let not the mighty boast of his 
might, let not a rich man boast of his riches; but 
let him who boasts of this, that he understands 
and knows Me, that I am Lord who exercises 
lovingkindness, justice, and righteousness on 
earth; for I delight in these things.” 

Jeremiah 9:23-24 
 

May 11: 
“Ask the Father for whatever is in keeping with 
the things I’ve revealed to you.  Ask in My name, 
according to My will, and He’ll most certainly 
give it to you.  Your joy will be a river overflowing 
its banks!” 

John 16:23-24 
 

May 12: 
“The Lord is near to those who have a broken 
heart, and saves such as have a contrite spirit.  
Many are the afflictions of the righteous, but the 
Lord delivers him out of them all.” 

Psalm 34:18-19 
 

May 13: 
“Away from me, you evildoers, that I may keep 
the commands of my God!” 

Psalm 119:115 
 

May 14: 
“Praise the Lord, who has now provided a 
redeemer for your family!” 

Ruth 4:14 
 

May 15: 
“In Christ, there is no difference between Jew 
and Greek, slave and free person, male and 
female.  You are all the same in Christ Jesus.” 

Galatians 3:28 
 

May 16: 
“Submit therefore to God.  Resist the devil and 
he will flee from you.” 

James 4:7 
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May 17: 
“I have loved you with an everlasting love; 
therefore I have continued my faithfulness to 
you….Keep your voice from weeping, and your 
eyes from tears; for there is a reward for your 
work, says the Lord………..…there is hope for your 
future.”  

Jeremiah 31:3, 16-17 
 

May 18: 
“Therefore be imitators of God as dear children.  
And walk in love, as Christ also has loved us and 
given Himself for us, an offering and a sacrifice 
to God for a sweet-smelling aroma.” 

Ephesians 5:1-2 
 

May 19: 
“Lift up your hands in the sanctuary and praise 
the Lord.” 

Psalms 134:2 
 

May 20: 
“Neither death, nor life, nor angels, nor 
principalities, nor powers, nor things present, 
nor things to come, nor height, nor depth, nor 
any other creature, shall be able to separate us 
from the love of God, which is in Christ Jesus our 
Lord.” 

Romans 8:38-39 
 

May 21: 
“Jesus replied, “You must love the Lord your God 
with all your heart, all your soul, and all your 
mind.” 

Matthew 22:37 
 

May 22: 
“Give thanks to the Lord, for he is good.” 

Psalm 136:1 
 

May 23: 
“Now that you have purified yourself by obeying 
the truth so that you have sincere love for your 
brothers, love one another deeply, from the 
heart.” 

1 Peter 1:22 
 

May 24: 
“Have not I commanded thee?  Be strong and of 
a good courage; be not afraid, neither be thou 
dismayed: for the LORD thy God is with thee 
whithersoever thou goest.” 

Joshua 1:9 
May 25: 
“Grace and peace be yours in abundance 
through the knowledge of God and of Jesus our 
Lord” 

2 Peter 1:2 
 

May 26: 
“Many are asking, “Who can show us any good? 
Let the light of you face shine upon us, O Lord.” 

Psalms 4:6 
 

May 27: 
“If he sins against you seven times in one day and 
says that he is sorry each time, forgive him.” 

Luke 17:4 
 

May 28: 
“But do not forget this one thing, dear friends: 
With the Lord a day is like a thousand years, and 
a thousand years are like a day.” 

2 Peter 3:8 
 

May 29: 
“The LORD delights in those who fear him, who 
put their hope in his unfailing love.” 

Psalm 147:11 
 

May 30: 
“Yes, I am the vine; you are the branches.  Those 
who remain in me, and I in them, will produce 
much fruit.  For apart from me you can do 
nothing.” 

John 15:5 
 

May 31: 
“But we thank God!  He gives us the victory 
through our Lord Jesus Christ.” 

1 Corinthians 15:57 
 

 


